
Bid Tabulation 
Buyer: Karim Galeana
Proj Mgr: Justin Brazil
RFQ No. RFQ S2025-06 Water Treatment Chemicals
Bid Due: April 24, 2025, by 2:00 P.M.

Bid Item 
No.

Chemical Delivery 
Location UM Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

1 Cationic Polymer 20% PWTP Pounds No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.8100$            No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.6300$            No Bid No Bid
2 Ammonium Sulfate NCW Pounds No Bid 1.4850$            No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.1800$  
3 Chlorine (1 Ton Containers) PWTP Tons No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,897.0000$     No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 Ferric Chloride 43% (Typical) PWTP Dry Tons No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,495.0000$     No Bid No Bid 1,500.0000$     No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5A Sodium Hypochlorite 12.5% RDF Gallons No Bid 2.5700$            No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.3800$            No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.9000$            No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.3940$            No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.4400$  
5B Sodium Hypochlorite 12.5% NCW Gallons No Bid 2.5700$            No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.3800$            No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.1000$            No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.7840$            No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.9700$  
5C Sodium Hypochlorite 12.5% RCS-1 Gallons No Bid 4.2500$            No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.3800$            No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5D Sodium Hypochlorite 12.5% RCS-2 Gallons No Bid 4.2500$            No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.3800$            No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 Aqua Ammonia 19.0% PWTP Gallons 1.2950$  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.2800$            No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7 Liquid Ammonium Sulfate 40% RDF Gallons No Bid 1.8980$            No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.9900$            1.6900$            No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.4500$  

8A Sodium Hydroxide PWTP Dry Tons No Bid 850.0000$        No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 909.0000$        No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 840.0000$  No Bid No Bid 808.2500$  
8B Sodium Hydroxide RDF Dry Tons No Bid 968.0000$        No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,066.0000$     No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 920.0000$  No Bid No Bid 950.1600$  
9 Ferrous Chloride PWTP Dry Tons No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1,595.0000$     No Bid No Bid 1,600.0000$     No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10 Activated Carbon Powder PWTP Pounds No Bid No Bid 1.6800$            No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.5500$            No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.9000$            No Bid
11 Aluminum Sulfate 45-55% RDF Pounds No Bid 0.6625$            No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.5600$  
12 Sodium Chlorite 31% PWTP Pounds No Bid 1.3590$            No Bid No Bid 0.8870$            No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.9070$            No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

13A Fluorosilicic Acid (23-25%) PWTP Pounds No Bid 0.2950$            No Bid 0.2935$            No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
13B Fluorosilicic Acid (23-25%) RDF Pounds No Bid 0.3450$            No Bid 0.3485$            No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
14 Sodium Fluoride (90–98%) NCW Pounds No Bid 2.9500$            1.9300$            No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.2600$  

15A Citric Acid (Granular) RDF Pounds No Bid 2.0500$            1.5900$            No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.2900$  
15B Citric Acid (Granular) PWTP Pounds No Bid 2.0500$            1.5900$            No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.2900$  
16 Copper Sulfate (Granular) PWTP Pounds No Bid 4.5500$            3.4700$            No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.0000$  
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Univar Solutions USA Inc. 
Pricing:
CARB fee of $15/DST will be 
applied to sodium hydroxide.                             
True unit price for bid item 
number 8A: $823.25/DT    
True unit price for bid item 
number 8B: $965.16/DT

Equal Low Bidder
Lowest Bidder

Pacific Star Chemical LLC 
Pricing:
CARB fee of $15/DST will be 
applied to sodium 
hydroxide. Effective 5/1, a 
tarriff fee of $45/DST will 
be applied to sodium 
hydroxide and adjusted 
monthly.
True unit price for bid item 
number 8A: $900/DT  True 
unit price for bid item 
number 8B: $980/DT

Sole Bidder
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